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RASĀYAN J. Chem. <editor@rasayanjournal.com> Mon, Aug 8, 2022 at 13:00
To: Boima Situmeang <boimatumeang@gmail.com>

Received, thank you. 

On Wed, 3 Aug 2022 at 13:57, Boima Situmeang <boimatumeang@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editor Rasayan Journal

We attached the file Copy right Form and Letter of Original work below.

The number of article RJC 7084

thank you

On Thu, 28 Jul 2022 at 13:12, RASĀYAN J. Chem. <editor@rasayanjournal.com> wrote:

Acceptance Letter: Ms. Ref. No. RJC-7084
 
Dear Author,
             
Greetings from RASĀYAN Journal of Chemistry, 
Congratulations! Your above-mentioned manuscript has been accepted for the
publication in the latest issue of RASĀYAN Journal of Chemistry, i.e. Vol. 15, No.4, 2022
issue.
 
Herewith please find attached the  Acceptance Letter  and  Invoice for your above-
mentioned manuscript.
 
Also, find Copyright Transfer Form and Letter of Original Work attached. Please send
these duly filled and signed docs as soon as possible.
 
Note: RJC is a SCOPUS (Elsevier)  indexed International Research Journal of Chemical
Sciences [Since 2008 and its current CiteScore 2021 is 2.0, for the authentic Source
Details, please visit: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/19400157518?origin=sbrowse]. It’s
also approved by UGC (India) and included in its CARE list.
 
I look forward to hearing from you in the near future.
Yours Sincerely,
Best regards,
Dr. Sanjay K. Sharma, FRSC

On Mon, 25 Jul 2022 at 19:10, Boima Situmeang <boimatumeang@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editor Rasayan Journal of Chemistry

we have pay the payment of our article and we attach the APC file and payment proof,
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thank you

best regards

Widyawati, Boima Situmeang

On Sat, 16 Jul 2022 at 17:28, RASĀYAN J. Chem. <editor@rasayanjournal.com> wrote:

Dear Author,
Greetings from RASĀYAN Journal of Chemistry, 
RJC is a SCOPUS (Elsevier)  indexed International Research Journal of
Chemical Sciences [Since 2008 and the current CiteScore 2021 is 2.0, for
the authentic Source Details, please visit: https://www.scopus.com/

sourceid/19400157518?origin=sbrowse]. Its also approved by UGC (India) and
included in its CARE list.
 
Your paper RJC-7084 has been evaluated and can be published. We may
inform you that we have a policy of Article Procession Charges, the
cost of your paper shall be USD 500 (USD Five Hundred only).
 
The paper shall be published in Vol.15, No.4, 2022 of RASĀYAN Journal
of Chemistry.
We are very happy to share with you that  SJR  powered by  SCOPUS

(Elsevier)  announced the Journal Ranking# of Indian Journals
abstracted in SCOPUS (Elsevier) and  its matter of proud for us

that  RASĀYAN J. Chem.  is on  2nd  rank  in this list and
having significantly high H-index value =36; which is quite encouraging
and a proved evidence of the international quality publications in this
journal. See the Link-http://www.scimagojr.com/journalrank.php?
category=1601&area=1600&country=IN&year=2017
 
We assign  DOI  to every manuscript published in  RASAYAN J. Chem.  ,
which is assigned by CrossRef, an international organization known for
quality control of scientific content. A manuscript linked with a DOI will
be visible and searchable from all platforms and devices just on a click. 
 
Kindly send payment within 10 days from the date of this mail,
otherwise, we shall presume that you are not interested in publishing

mailto:editor@rasayanjournal.com
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this paper with us and we shall take up other pending papers for
publication in this issue.
Payment should be done ONLY by the corresponding author or any
of the authors, NOT by third person. You are requested to send the
Filled attached APC Clearance Slip along with the Receipt of the
payment.
 
Note: In case, If you think that your Manuscript is related to any one of
17 SDG goals, mention the Goal in the Subject Line with Receipt of the
Payment. The manuscript will be considered for the Special Hardbound
Thematic Issue-2022(the Call for Papers attached).
 
Note:

1.             *Formal acceptance letters and Comments of Reviewers for
Revision shall be sent as soon as the payment is received.
2.           You can send the payment either by Draft in favor of RASAYAN
Journal of Chemistry, payable at Jaipur or cash deposit in Bank of
Baroda in our account or NEFT from any Bank or Net banking.

 
Bank details:

A/C Holder: RASĀYAN Journal of Chemistry, Jaipur
A/C no.: 29720200000312, Current Account

Bank: Bank of Baroda, DCM Branch, Ajmer Road, Jaipur (Rajasthan)
India

SWIFT Code: BARBINBBJAI
IFS Code: BARB0DCMAJM

With Regards, your’s-
Dr. Pratima Sharma
Managing Editor, RASĀYAN Journal of Chemistry

On Thu, 14 Jul 2022 at 15:51, Boima Situmeang <boimatumeang@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear editor Rasayan Journal
We want to ask about aur article prosses wih Manuscript No RJC 7084/2022

Its been 2 month after revised our article.

Thank you

On Wed, May 25, 2022, 12:26 RASĀYAN J. Chem. <editor@rasayanjournal.com> wrote:
Thanks, I have received it. 
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On Mon, 23 May 2022 at 14:24, Boima Situmeang <boimatumeang@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editor Rasayan Journal of Chemistry
we have been revission our article with Manuscript No.: RJC-7084/2022 (turnitin check,
grammarly) and we attach the file below.

thank you

with sincereely
Widyawati

--
With Kindest Regards,
Prof. Sanjay K. Sharma, FRSC
Editor-in-Chief | RASAYAN Journal of Chemistry,
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My Books
t: +91 9414202678
m: +91 9001699997
e: editor@rasayanjournal.com
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With Kindest Regards,
Prof. Sanjay K. Sharma, FRSC
Editor-in-Chief | RASAYAN Journal of Chemistry,
www.rasayanjournal.com
My Books
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